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***************************************************************** 

Positions of Planets at Birth: 

Sun      6 Vir 09               Pluto     2 Vir 10 
Moon    14 Pis 54               True Node23 Lib 05 

Mercury 25 Leo 25               Asc.     10 Pis 07 
Venus   17 Leo 04               MC       19 Sag 32 
Mars    22 Tau 02               2nd cusp 26 Ari 44 

Jupiter 28 Lib 32               3rd cusp 27 Tau 00 
Saturn  19 Sag 07               5th cusp 10 Can 18 

Uranus  13 Leo 30               6th cusp  4 Leo 17 
Neptune  2 Sco 35 
Part of Fortune: 18 Vir 53  (Note: Modern formula used) 

 
Tropical  Placidus   Daylight Savings Time observed 

GMT: 00:33:00   Time Zone: 6 hours West 
Lat. and Long. of birth: 41 N 35 36 87 W 20 47 
 

Aspects and orbs: 
Conjunction:  7 Deg 00 Min 

Opposition :  4 Deg 00 Min 
Square     :  5 Deg 00 Min 
Trine      :  5 Deg 00 Min 

Sextile    :  5 Deg 00 Min 
 

***************************************************************** 
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INTRODUCTION 

 

Report and Text Copyright By Lorna Houston and Cosmic Patterns Software, Inc.  

The contents of this report are protected by Copyright law. 

By purchasing this report you agree to comply with this Copyright. 

 

     This report is about how you can increase your financial prosperity. 

 

     We were all created by God, and God is infinitely prosperous. We were all created in the image of 

God and we are, therefore, intended to be prosperous. In fact, if we are not prosperous, it just means 

that there is a block standing in the way of our prosperity, because prosperity is our natural state. 

 

     Astrology is an excellent tool for removing any blocks we may have to prosperity and discovering 

who we really are, so that we can realize our full potential of being prosperous. 

 

     There have been several well-known writers who have described how to become prosperous and 

how to overcome blocks to prosperity. They include Leonard Orr, Louise Hay, Dr. Wayne Dyer, Dr. 

Joseph Murphy, Norvell and others, and they all advocate positive thinking. They provide general 

advice, and it is all good, but it is not as individualized as astrology. 

 

     Because we are individuals, we each have our own vision of what it means to be prosperous, what 

to do with our money if we are prosperous, and what makes us want to be prosperous. We also differ 

as to what blocks may be standing in the way of our attaining wealth and what might make us still not 

feel happy if we did. That is why advice based on your own unique, astrological chart is the best way 

to connect you, as an individual, with the ideals of the positive thinking experts and to guide you as to 

how you, personally, can obtain wealth and be happy with it. 

 

     The central idea the positive thinking experts teach is that thought is creative, and that what 

thoughts you think ultimately determine your creation of wealth. When your rational mind is relaxed, 

your thoughts go into your subconscious mind and affect the way you feel and behave and impact 

others, even though you might not be consciously aware of it. Therefore, if you can relax your 

conscious mind and introduce positive thoughts about creating prosperity, these new thoughts will 

replace whatever other thoughts might already be in your subconscious mind. You will then, after 

whatever repetition of the new thoughts is necessary, feel, behave, and impact others in accordance 

with your new, positive, prosperous thoughts. This, in turn, will attract prosperity to you. That is 

because of the law of action and reaction (also called "the law of karma" and referred to in the biblical 

quotation of "As ye sow, so shall ye reap.") You are now putting out thoughts of prosperity, as these 

have become manifested in your subconscious and your actions, and now only prosperity can come 

back to you. The thoughts you choose to think determine your prosperity. That is the teaching. 

 

     If you put together this general knowledge of how you can choose your thoughts and create what 

you want through your subconscious mind with a knowledge of who you are as a unique individual, 

you have the best possible combination for creating wealth and having a good experience with it. For 

example, some people need to introduce a lot of positive thoughts to offset an ongoing negative state 

of mind, whereas some others, of a happy disposition, may manifest wealth quite readily at the very 

suggestion of it, but then not have the stability to handle it. The approach taken in this report is to 

identity your individual needs and temperament and then to suggest ways of creating prosperity which 

will work out best for you. 
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Chapter 1: The Sun 

 

     Your sun sign shows how you radiate warmth, light, love and energy. If you give out all 

this goodness, you cannot help but receive prosperity in return. Money is really energy, and it 
has been said that wealth goes to wealth. The more that you radiate your true energy as to who 

you really are, the more others will respond to your leadership, your self-confidence, and your 
positive inspiration. Your confidence in yourself gives you the innate belief that you are 
deserving of money. You then act as if it is natural for others to give you money; they follow 

the leadership of your divine inner light. You are one with the Infinite Light within you, and 
therefore have infinite potential to create wealth. 

 
     Discover where your heart is - what you most love to do for a living - and your inner 
power will shine through. Do not just do what others expect of you or what will please them; 

it is your own birthright to shine and to be happy. When you are happy, you give the most to 
others and to the world - and you receive the most wealth in return. 

 
Sun in Virgo: 
 

     Your down-to-earth practicality is a great asset in your acquisition of wealth. You look for 
things of solid value and actual utility. You make good use of what you already own, and this 

prevents the need to replace things. Because of your frugality, you have money left over to 
invest or to buy new items you really want. 
 

     You have superior bookkeeping skills, and you keep your financial house in order. You 
invest only in things that have a realistic likelihood of financial return. You may do well 

investing in utilities or anything which will always be needed by people; even if the profits 
are slow and gradual, they will always be there. You could also benefit from "green investing" 
in something which will make a cleaner planet. 

 
Sun in 6th house: 

 
     You attract prosperity through your good and careful service to others. You take pride in 
accuracy and, in return, others are inspired to pay you in full. 

 
     You may work in the health care field. You may be an accountant or bookkeeper. You may 

be a waiter or waitress. You give to others in a practical and useful way, and your work 
successfully provides you with the material things you need. 
 

Sun Sextile Neptune: 
 

     You have a gift for manifesting financial success through your very finely tuned 
perceptions. Your psychic ability enables you to tune in to the trends as to how things are 
going, and then you can invest your money accordingly. In order to make sure that your 

perceptions are correct and not just illusions, make sure that you avoid drugs, alcohol, 
pollution, or anything which could cloud your thinking. In that way, you can achieve your full 

potential. Your talent might also be applied to any of the creative arts such as painting, 
sculpture or music, where you could find financial prosperity. 
 

Sun Conjunct Pluto: 
 

     You have a rare ability to change your wealth around. This comes from your very 
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concentrated willpower. It is important that you remember that your talent comes from your 
Higher Self and that it is a gift. Otherwise your willpower might turn into an equally negative 
force, which could lead to oppressing other people for your own ends. They would then 

oppose you and you would be wasting your energy in a big battle, rather than just being able 
to be happy with your prosperity. Your karma would be very positive if you put some of your 

attention into helping others go from rags to riches, based on your shining example. 
 
Sun Opposition Asc.: 

 
     You face the challenge of being able to project yourself to others as you really are. The 

solution to this is to keep your awareness on a higher, spiritual plane, so that you know that 
what counts is how much influence you have, not who gets the credit for it. By the law of 
karma, you are the one who will be rewarded in the long run with prosperity for your efforts. 

You would shine working with a partner, as you know how to cooperate for very happy 
results. 

 
 
 

Chapter 2: The Moon 

 

     Your Moon position is very important because it represents your subconscious mind and 
your receptivity to new beliefs about how you can attain prosperity. 
 

     As your moon governs your feelings and emotional responses, the more you nurture 
yourself and create happy feelings, the more receptive you will be to thoughts about 

prosperity. So, neutralize any negative thought or feeling which comes up by first 
acknowledging it and identifying it and then affirming the opposite. For example, if you feel 
depressed because you do not believe you can make enough money, you can affirm "I am 

joyous and receptive to prosperity." At first, you might find the new belief hard to accept, but 
keep affirming and you will come to believe it. You created the negative thought, whether 

consciously or not, so now you can create a new positive thought to replace it. Own your own 
ability to transform your thoughts and the feelings they give rise to. Choose the positive and 
prosperity. 

 
     Protect your positive beliefs and feelings. Nurture them. Associate with people who 

believe in you. Avoid negative people. Picture yourself being prosperous and build on that 
image. What you nurture will grow. 
 

Moon in Pisces: 
 

     Your approach to wealth involves passive receptivity rather than self-assertion. You are 
very psychic, and know exactly what to say to someone to make them want to give you 
money. You may flatter them or entertain them; perhaps you will appeal to their sympathy. In 

turn, you are very compassionate at helping those in need. You would rather lend your 
creative talent to a charitable cause than work in a structured job, but you receive enough 

money just the same, because of the good karma you create. 
 
Moon in 1st house: 

 
     This is a favorable position for having your mother help you get set up in your own small 

business. You may begin by working in her business, or she may provide you with money to 
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get you started, or she may help you out with the work. Your mother showed you how to be 
competitive and independent. Your business may involve selling food. You know how to deal 
with customers by taking the initiative to make them feel cared for. 

 
Moon Square Saturn: 

 
     You may feel as if your prosperity is being held back by the effects of your mother's 
poverty in the past. You need to learn to look on the bright side of things. Remember that 

your mother gave you life and that your life now is what you make of it. Nurture yourself with 
the positive thoughts about prosperity that your mother was unable to provide for you. By 

doing this, you would be doing what any mother would have wanted for her child. You are 
deserving of prosperity as anyone else. 
 

Moon Conjunct Asc.: 
 

     Because you readily express outwardly your emotions and inner, subconscious state, it will 
readily contribute to your prosperity if you consciously introduce positive prosperity 
affirmations into your subconscious mind. If you think positive, optimistic thoughts about 

money, others will readily pick up on your enthusiasm and nurture your efforts with financial 
rewards. They will see that you want to provide for your home and family, and they will agree 

that that is good thing. 
 
Moon Opposition Part of Fortune: 

 
     You have learned that if you nurture yourself and take care of your own needs, you can 

find great joy in life. Your positive self-esteem attracts many happy experiences to you, 
including better financial rewards. You can enjoy helping others awaken to the fact that they 
are loved children of God, who can enjoy a prosperous, fulfilling life. It is a matter of having 

faith that security and good fortune are possible, and this attitude comes from within. 
 

 
 

Chapter 3: Mercury 

 

     Mercury has to do with how you use your mind and how you communicate. The more you 

develop your mind and learn about different subjects, the more versatile you are and the more 
ways you have of becoming prosperous. 
 

     Mercury also rules anything which works like the mind, such as computers. Computers can 
facilitate your studies and your communication with others. Because computers were invented 

by the human mind, they give us insight into how our own mind works. We can use our minds 
to figure out ways in which computers can increase our prosperity. 
 

     Communication can lead to prosperity, whether it involves staying where you are and 
sending a message or actually traveling to another location to deliver it. Mercury represents 

the messenger - the ways in which one mind can communicate with another. The sharing of 
objective information leads to many opportunities for prosperity. 
 

Mercury in Leo: 
 

     Your financial success is related to your ability to think "big". You know that if you were 
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to get stuck in a low-paying job with no opportunity for promotion, you would be limiting 
your potential for prosperity. Instead, you know to look for a good-paying position which you 
will enjoy and which has a future. This could mean promotional opportunity, the chance to be 

your own boss, or work with children, who are our "future". You are also likely to invest in 
the lottery or stock market, where you could win "big". 

 
Mercury in 6th house: 
 

     You have an excellent mind for detail and you may be successful in the health or nutrition 
field, where many precise facts need to be remembered. You are concerned about cleanliness 

and could work as a cleaner or perhaps as a public health worker or environmental worker 
concerned with clean air and clean drinking water. Your pattern of thought for acquiring 
prosperity is that it is received in return for being of practical service to others. 

 
Mercury Square Mars: 

 
     It is best if your path to prosperity involves active, busy, physical work, so that your high 
energy level will not result in your becoming argumentative. You can cope with situations 

which others could not, such as being a cashier with a line-up of customers or a 
waiter/waitress in a busy restaurant. Your work is fast, accurate and efficient, and worthy of 

good financial returns. 
 
Mercury Sextile Jupiter: 

 
     You are a natural master of prosperity affirmations and positive thinking. This ability 

brings wealth into your life, because the way people think results in what they create. You 
find many opportunities to enhance your wealth, because your superior mind and higher 
education bring you into contact with persons who can advance your mission. For example, 

you might meet publishers for your ideas. You can especially benefit from travel. 
 

Mercury Conjunct Pluto: 
 
     Your key to prosperity is your awareness that you can bring deep, subtler forces into your 

mind and that willpower can allow you to choose to think prosperous thoughts. Prosperous 
thoughts, in turn, manifest as actual prosperity. It is all a matter of intelligent strategy. 

Because of your ability to probe to the deeper levels of knowledge, you could be successful as 
a detective or scientific researcher. 
 

 
 

Chapter 4: Venus 

 

     Venus rules the ways in which you relate to others and to the environment around you. It 

rules how you cooperate with others to make money and what attitudes you have about money 
and possessions. 

 
     Venus rules the sign of Libra, which relates to harmony and balance. Within yourself, you 
can best create prosperity if your male and female energies are balanced - that is, if you both 

affirm positive thoughts about money and receive them into your subconscious. You will then 
interact with others in such a way as to inspire them to aid your prosperity and be receptive to 

the prosperity they will create for you and ultimately with you, as you both move forward 
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together and share your growing wealth and happiness. 
 
     Venus also rules the earth sign of Taurus, which has to do with actual tangible wealth. As 

you work and create actual, tangible things in your environment, you will receive, in return, 
actual, tangible money and possessions. If you feel secure within, and affirm that you own 

enough money and possessions to be secure, you will create this reality and keep building 
more security for a happy and prosperous future. 
 

Venus in Leo: 
 

     You would have good luck investing in gold. You know how to think big, and gold is the 
universally recognized form of money. Choose gold bullion, rather that just collectors' coins 
which are not pure gold. You are also likely to have good luck in contests and lotteries, and 

you could win big prizes. Invest when you feel lucky, and do not spend more than you can 
afford to lose, as you have a tendency towards lavishness. 

 
Venus in 6th house: 
 

     You are favored to make good money from your work and to enjoy it as well. You are 
careful in your investments. You are likely to profit from them because you look for good, 

solid, long-term value and you take time to calculate what the profits of each option would be. 
You are likely to maintain good health, and health in itself is wealth. Your reliable work over 
the long term will bring you financial security. 

 
Venus Square Mars: 

 
     You need to guard against being too aggressive in the area of money, in order to create a 
good karma. Get plenty of physical exercise to divert your aggression and be consciously 

aware of being kinder with others. If you do this, others will be willing to do business with 
you, and you will make money. On the positive side, if someone is trying to take your money 

away from you, you will be assertive enough to stop them. 
 
Venus Trine Saturn: 

 
     Because you are able to create harmony and goodwill with others, you will prosper 

financially. You go out of your way to make sure that your customers are satisfied, and you 
even give them a little extra for their money. As a result, they come back to you and enjoy 
spending even more than they had planned. You are fortunate in your investments. 

 
Venus Conjunct Uranus: 

 
     This is a favorable placement for unexpected windfalls, such as winning contests or 
lotteries. You are able to increase your chances of winning by tuning in to your higher mind 

and consciously introducing the belief that you will win. Do a grounding exercise before 
beginning this meditation, so as to make sure that the win envisioned will actually become 

manifested. Have in mind a purpose for the money ahead of time, in harmony with your life 
goals. 
 

 
 

Chapter 5: Mars 
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     Mars gives you the energy and get-up-and-go to achieve prosperity goals. Mars gives you 
the physical strength and well-being to carry out your work with enthusiasm. It provides you 

with the initiative to start new ventures and the momentum to forge ahead in spite of 
obstacles. 

 
     Mars lift you out of the past and into the present. How can you achieve prosperity now? 
Where can you apply your initiative and become more independent? What kind of new 

venture would you like to start? 
 

     Mars gives you self-confidence. If you believe in yourself, you can create prosperity. You 
can promote yourself and your products with ease. You can convince the buyers that they, 
too, will feel good about themselves if they buy your products. 

 
Mars in Taurus: 

 
     You possess great initiative where money is concerned. You will set financial security as a 
goal and then you will work energetically and patiently to achieve it. Because you build 

concrete results for others in your work, you are rewarded in return with concrete wealth. You 
will work to acquire a good quality house and possessions. You will seek out secure 

investments for the long term. Your determination and perseverance will pay off. Your 
honesty and directness will ensure that you deal with trustworthy people. 
 

Mars in 2nd house: 
 

     This is an excellent placement for successfully running your own business. You like to be 
your own boss, and you like to make money. You have the capacity to work for long hours, as 
well as physical strength and stamina. You set ambitious goals, of owning a nice house and 

possessions and making your business grow. Then you proceed to work hard to achieve these 
goals. You may have the tendency to spend your money quickly rather than save it, so save a 

percentage of your earnings first. 
 
Mars Trine Part of Fortune: 

 
     You find great joy in working to put your religious beliefs into practice. You are inspired 

by your faith to do great good. You may even travel to other countries to show the people how 
to set up their own business enterprises, so that they can be more prosperous. You have 
worked hard and achieved your own financial success, and you are very generous in helping 

others. You find great fulfillment in seeing concrete gains which are the results of your 
efforts. 

 
 
 

Chapter 6: Jupiter 

 

     Jupiter is a very large planet, and it rules growth and expansion. You can grow in your 
prosperity by expanding your mind to see the many possibilities which are available to you. 
You can travel and see new ways of making money or expanding your business to other 

places. You can hire people to work for you and thereby multiply your efforts and your 
profits. 

 



 

World's Most Inspirational Astrological Reports  

 

10 

     It is through Jupiter that you are connected to your higher inspiration and your source of 
faith that you will be prosperous. Jupiter's energy is benevolent, optimistic and generous. If 
you give freely to others, in the faith that the source of prosperity is infinite, you create 

goodwill. You create a win-win situation where everyone involved will give to one another, 
and everyone will benefit. This is how a prosperous economy is created: If everyone keeps 

spending in the belief of a positive outcome, that outcome will be created. 
 
     If you put together Jupiter's ability to believe that new, positive goals can be achieved with 

Saturn's self-discipline to carry them out, you can actually manifest a huge amount of wealth. 
 

Jupiter in Libra: 
 
     You could become a very successful lawyer or judge, because you are fair, educated and 

honest. You have good moral values and a desire to contribute to the social good. Although 
you will marry for the highest altruistic reasons, your partner is, nevertheless, likely to be the 

source of great prosperity and financial wealth for you. You would have much to offer as a 
foreign diplomat, peace-maker, or mediator. Your excellent relationship skills would bring 
you much in return. 

 
Jupiter in 8th house: 

 
     You stand to benefit financially from helping others deal with intense topics which you, 
yourself, have the ability to rise above, such as death, taxes, insurance, and joint finances. 

Your career opportunities would include a funeral home business or giving out financial 
advice. You could work for an insurance company or accounting firm. You are likely to profit 

well from your own investments because of your positive attitude and your excellent 
understanding of financial strategies. 
 

Jupiter Conjunct Neptune: 
 

     You could be very prosperous in any field calling for creativity and imagination. Be 
careful in any kind of financial speculation or gambling because your fantasies about large 
financial gains are more likely to be an illusion rather than reality. Hire someone practical to 

handle your finances, so that you will be free to be creative. 
 

Jupiter Sextile Pluto: 
 
     This is a very favorable position for opportunities to gain wealth on a very large scale. You 

are likely to create very positive karma in your mission to make the world a better place. You 
could become a spiritual teacher or lecturer in other countries, a successful publisher of 

inspiring literature or an exporter of goods which will genuinely benefit mankind. Your 
positive influence can be very far-reaching in showing others how to rise above poverty and 
create wealth. 

 
 

 
Chapter 7: Saturn 

 

     Saturn rules the setting of goals and the work to achieve them. In order to get ahead, it is 
all well and fine to have dreams, visions of possibilities, and enthusiasm, but what is also 

needed is the discipline and focus to choose the best, most practical possibilities and then put 
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in the necessary labor to achieve them. If you have first explored many options, with your 
Jupiter, Saturn will give you the wisdom of discernment - the ability to decide from your vast, 
accumulated knowledge of what will work and what will not. 

 
     Provided that you have already explored your visions and dreams thoroughly, your choice 

of action will be one upon which you will embark with enthusiasm and inner calmness. The 
work which you will do to carry out your chosen aims will not really seem like work, because 
it will be what you have already decided, beyond any doubt, is the thing which you most want 

to do. You will be able to handle, with ease, the responsibilities connected with it. 
 

     Saturn then, rules the actual manifestation of goals and the actual wealth, honor, and 
recognition. 
 

Saturn in Sagittarius: 
 

     If you really work as doing prosperity affirmations and goal-setting exercises over a long 
period of time, you will meet with untold success! In fact, you have the potential to become a 
millionaire. It is all a matter of clearing your subconscious mind of the effects of any past 

over-indulgences, including those of your parents and grandparents. Follow good religious 
values and work hard to get a good education. 

 
Saturn in 9th house: 
 

     You would achieve tremendous prosperity by being consistent in your practice of positive 
affirmations. As your past blocks to prosperity melt away, you would manifest more and more 

fulfillment of your goals. You would work hard to get a higher education, and then you would 
find many financial opportunities at the top. These could include career possibilities in 
lecturing, publishing or business. You may well enjoy travel in connection with your work. 

 
Saturn Square Part of Fortune: 

 
     You have great determination to work hard and overcome hardship so that you can become 
prosperous. Because of your positive attitude, you will most certainly succeed. You realize 

that fulfillment comes not just from a high-sounding philosophy but from setting practical 
goals and achieving them. You enjoy your work, even if it is hard, and you responsibly 

manage the profits that you make. 
 
 

 
Chapter 8: Uranus 

 

     Uranus rules freedom, and the freedom which prosperity can bring. 
 

     Uranus rules your higher mind, in which your thoughts, hopes, and wishes can be infinitely 
free. It rules your highest ideals, which prosperity can enable you to attain. 

 
     Because your higher mind is the source of your sudden flashes of intuition, Uranus is 
associated with sudden changes in your prosperity, for better or for worse. If your thoughts 

have been genuinely free, as in the meditative state, you can suddenly win prizes or attract 
prosperous offers, seemingly out of nowhere. If your thoughts have been too controlled, you 

are likely to lose money suddenly, as an expression of Uranus trying to tell you to break free 
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from your oppressive circumstances. You then need to affirm your right to freedom of thought 
to attract prosperity. Affirm that Divine Light flows through you, so that the ideals in your 
higher consciousness will come down into your everyday life. 

 
     Be inventive. Use group energy to create synergy - individuals working together to free 

themselves and claim their divine right to be prosperous. 
 
Uranus in Leo: 

 
     You were born into a generation of people who had a great deal of self-confidence about 

their right to express their freedom. They openly question everything, and the economy 
changed as a result. They believed that they could wear whatever they wanted, as long as they 
did their job, and employers had to adapt to this change. In fact, most forms of authority were 

very successfully changed. Consumer rights gained ground, and workplaces became more 
cooperatively oriented. 

 
Uranus in 6th house: 
 

     You have a brain which is both unusually inventive and greatly practical. You could use 
your genius to cure diseases or, better still, prevent them from manifesting in the first place. 

You could be a very successful alternative health care practitioner, such as a naturopath, 
chiropractor, energy healer, or nutritionist. You work best independently, rather than having 
to obey a boss. You would also work well in a group where everyone is equal. 

 
 

 
Chapter 9: Neptune 

 

     The energy of Neptune is very subtle and beyond the realm of attachment to money. In 
fact, Neptune rules Pisces, the sign of the fish, and its influence is just to make money flow in 

and out of your life without paying conscious attention to it, just as the water flows along 
where a fish lives. 
 

     The influence of Neptune has to do with sharing with the less fortunate in a compassionate 
way, in order to keep the flow of money going. If money flows into your life, it needs to keep 

going and keep the subtler, karmic cycle going. If you share with others in their time of need, 
you will be provided for by others in the future. 
 

     Some individuals choose consciously to renounce their money and possessions in favor of 
living a more spiritual life. They find happiness and fulfillment in values which are above and 

beyond the material plane. Some access that higher plane and come back with creative 
inspiration for their artistic endeavors or channeled insights from higher, spiritual beings 
which can assist others. 

 
Neptune in Scorpio: 

 
     You were born at a time when the economy had secret strategies going on and the world's 
economy centered around drugs, arms, and oil. The strategists made money but many people 

became poor and/or addicted. Yet, there was great depth of emotion and compassion, and the 
intimate ways in which people shared their feelings protected their happiness and gave them a 

sense of well-being, however illusionary. 
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Neptune in 8th house: 
 

     You could obtain employment helping the poor work out their money problems. You 
would be both compassionate and courageous in helping them turn their circumstances 

around. You could show them the best financial strategies and make sure that they would be 
better prepared for anything which could happen. 
 

Neptune Sextile Pluto: 
 

     This aspect has to do with the age in which you were born, rather than with your prosperity 
as an individual. Most people alive today have this aspect in their natal chart. Economically, it 
is a relatively fortunate age, in which peace and financial security ultimately prevail. There 

are major challenges and danger to overcome, but ample opportunity for compassion and 
regenerative willpower to win out and solve these problems. 

 
 
 

Chapter 10: Pluto 

 

     The contribution of Pluto - the outermost planet - to our prosperity is to help us realize that 
the most extreme transformations imaginable are possible. For example, if you have lost 
money, it is equally possible that you can gain money, and even more than you had before. 

 
     Because prosperity is first created in the thoughts we choose to think and then in the 

manifested, physical, outer world, it stands to reason that the more deeply and intensely we 
think our thoughts of prosperity, the more prosperous we will become. Pluto gives us that 
willpower to reach the deepest, core beliefs which we have in our unconscious mind. Once we 

identify and transform our core beliefs, huge, far-reaching changes will occur in our 
prosperity and our happiness. 

 
     Pluto also rules the economy on a mass scale. We are influenced by the overall world 
trends and we, in turn, have an influence on them. If we use our willpower to rise above mass 

consciousness, we can still be prosperous in any economy, because we ultimately create our 
own reality. 

 
Pluto in Virgo: 
 

     You were born in an age when health care changed greatly, with the realization that 
preventive and holistic methods of healing were the key to self-empowerment and individuals 

were responsible for their own health. An economy grew out of this of alternative healers and 
client-centered practitioners. Health food stores became popular because of concern about the 
purity of food. Methods of health care from other countries became known, such as yoga and 

Tai Chi. New advances in health research were made. 
 

Pluto in 6th house: 
 
     You could be very successful in the field of labor relations and establishing good working 

conditions for employees. You could do this as either a model employer or union 
representative. Your talent might also be applied in the health field, where you could 

successfully work wonders in regenerating you own health or that of other people. Work has a 
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transformative effect on your outlook and your opportunities for prosperity. You could 
become a successful accountant, depending on other indicators in your chart. 
 

 
 

Chapter 11: The Ascendant 

 

     Your Ascendant represents your own self-expression. Once you have combined your 

positive, conscious thoughts for prosperity with the absorption of these thoughts by the 
subconscious mind, your new, outward expression shows the world how ready you are to 

acquire prosperity. 
 
     Traditionally, your Ascendant indicates your career; the area of life where you are best 

prepared, and best talented, to offer your work to others in exchange for money. On the higher 
level, your Ascendant represents your mission in life, your outward path towards making the 

world a better place. In return for doing this, you receive prosperity. In your own, self-
expressive mission, you are going beyond the expectations of what others think you should be 
doing to achieve your own, higher goals. 

 
     Your Ascendant is your outward personality, the impression which others first have of you 

and what they most immediately respond to. Sometimes first impressions are the basis of 
whether others are willing to do business with you. However, remember that your Ascendant 
has the input of your conscious and subconscious mind. Therefore, others are really 

responding to your deeper thoughts and affirmations as well. 
 

Ascendant in Pisces: 
 
     Your means of acquiring prosperity is very directly connected to the subtle receptivity of 

your subconscious mind. Rather than actively going after money, you are more likely to let it 
be attracted to you. For example, others may give you money so that you can pursue your 

artistic or musical talent. Your psychic ability enables you to tune in to other people and 
figure out what will please them and get them to spend their money. You are very 
compassionate to those in need and your good karma attracts prosperity in return. 

 
 

 
Chapter 12: The Part of Fortune 

 

     Your Part of Fortune is a special, astrological indicator of your prosperity potential. It is 
shown in your chart by a circle with an "X" in it. It represents a position calculated from your 

Sun, Moon and Ascendant, rather than being an actual planet in the sky. It is a symbolic 
representation of where the energies of your Sun, Moon, and Ascendant best work together 
for your prosperity and well being. Your Part of Fortune is one of several of what are called 

Arabian Parts, from Arabian astrology, which pertain to different aspects of your life, 
including your prosperity. 

 
     Your Part of Fortune has a connotation something like that of Jupiter, but it goes beyond 
Jupiter. It represents prosperity, wealth, optimism, benevolence and good fortune like Jupiter. 

However, it also represents your awareness within and how you focus it on prosperity. The 
Sun, Moon, and Rising Sign (Ascendant) were already there, outside of you, when you were 

born. However, it is through your own conscious willpower, having command over your 
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subconscious beliefs, and expressing these new, positive beliefs, that you achieve prosperity. 
It is in your overall, individual aura that your prosperity potential is expressed and this is 
represented by your Part of Fortune. 

 
Part of Fortune in Virgo: 

 
     Your prosperity and joy come from your successful achievement of good health. You have 
mastered the knowledge of how to keep healthy, and you can now live in the Light of healthy 

food choices, exercise, and vitality, pure thoughts, and an immaculate environment. You can 
celebrate your ability to elevate others to good health, by your practical service to them. You 

can rejoice in the important mission you are carrying out. You can witness the Divine in 
others as you see their health problems disappear and their inner purity emerge. 
 

Part of Fortune in 7th house: 
 

     Your greatest prosperity and joy in life comes from harmonious relationships. Your happy 
marriage is a celebration of your life's fulfillment! There are so many things you can do for 
your spouse and so many kindnesses which he or she can do in return for you! The vision of 

peace and cooperation which you so clearly have is a joyous mission which you share with 
others too, perhaps in your friendship and perhaps in your work. You know that you are 

making the world a more beautiful and harmonious place. 
 
 

* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 
 

 


